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Marginalised character: Conflict with Self 
 

1. The Internal Battle of Identity: A young person from a mixed-race background 
struggles to embrace their dual heritage, torn between the two cultures and 
facing internal conflict about where they truly belong. 

 
2. Confronting Mental Health Stigma: A person with a mental health condition 

faces self-doubt and denial while trying to accept their diagnosis and seek 
help, battling against the stigma associated with mental illness. 

 
3. Overcoming Self-Destructive Habits: A marginalized character deals with 

addiction and must confront their own self-destructive behaviour, striving to 
break free from the cycle and find a path to recovery. 

 
4. The Weight of Self-Expectations: A high-achieving student from a 

disadvantaged background puts immense pressure on themselves to 
succeed, grappling with feelings of inadequacy and imposter syndrome. 

 
5. Healing from Past Trauma: An individual who survived a traumatic event 

struggles with post-traumatic stress, experiencing flashbacks and nightmares 
while trying to find healing and inner peace. 

 
6. Embracing Sexual Orientation: A person comes to terms with their LGBTQ+ 

identity, dealing with internalized homophobia or transphobia and learning to 
love and accept themselves as they are. 

 
7. Discovering Self-Worth: A marginalized character faces low self-esteem due 

to years of societal discrimination and negative messaging, leading to a 
journey of self-discovery and building self-confidence. 

 
8. Navigating Cultural Clash: An immigrant grapples with cultural conflicts 

between their traditional upbringing and the new values they encounter in 
their adopted country, struggling to find a balance that feels authentic. 

 
9. Escaping the Chains of Internalized Racism: An Aboriginal person internalizes 

harmful stereotypes about their own race, leading to self-hatred and a 
journey towards breaking free from the mental shackles of racism. 

 
10. Accepting Physical Disabilities: A character acquires a physical disability, 

grappling with feelings of loss and bitterness, but ultimately embarks on a 
path of self-acceptance and adaptation, finding strength in their unique 
abilities. 
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Marginalised character: Conflict with Other 
 

1. The Outsider's Dilemma: A marginalized character Alex finds themselves 
isolated in a new town. They face conflict as they attempt to break into a 
tight-knit social group that rejects outsiders, leading to internal struggles with 
self-identity and self-worth. 

 
2. A Battle for Recognition: Mia, a talented artist from a disadvantaged 

background, faces conflict in the art world, where her work is often 
overlooked or dismissed due to her socio-economic status. She must fight to 
gain recognition and prove her worth in a prestigious art competition. 

 
3. The Unseen Struggle: John, a person with a hidden disability, experiences 

discrimination and prejudice in the workplace. He must confront his 
colleagues' biases while working towards being treated as an equal and 
gaining opportunities for career advancement. 

 
4. Breaking Stereotypes: Maya, a strong-willed woman of colour, challenges 

societal stereotypes and expectations as she strives to become the first 
female captain in a male-dominated industry, facing both overt and subtle 
opposition from colleagues and superiors. 

 
5. The Quest for Belonging: Chris, a non-binary individual, grapples with their 

gender identity while trying to find acceptance in a conservative family and 
community that struggle to understand or embrace their true self. 

 
6. Confronting Institutional Racism: Jamal, a young Aboriginal man, encounters 

systemic racism in the justice system. He becomes entangled in a wrongful 
criminal accusation, and his journey involves fighting against discrimination 
and seeking justice. 

 
7. The Weight of Prejudice: Elena, an immigrant from a war-torn country, faces 

xenophobia and discrimination as she tries to build a new life in a foreign 
land. Her conflicts involve overcoming cultural barriers and prejudice from 
locals. 

 
8. The Struggle for Education: Ahmed, a refugee with limited access to 

education, embarks on a dangerous journey to attend school in a 
neighbouring country. Along the way, he encounters hostility from both fellow 
students and authorities. 

 
9. The Price of Activism: Sarah, an environmental activist from an impoverished 

community, confronts powerful corporations polluting her neighbourhood. 
She faces threats, intimidation, and personal sacrifices as she fights for a 
cleaner and healthier environment. 

 
10. The Fight for Love: LGBTQ+ teenager Alex struggles to come out to their 

conservative parents and peers. The conflict revolves around battling societal 
expectations, dealing with rejection, and navigating self-acceptance in the 
face of adversity. 
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Marginalised character: Conflict with Society 
 

1. The Fight for Equal Rights: A marginalized character becomes a leader in a 
civil rights movement, advocating for the rights and equality of their 
community, while facing opposition from a society that resists change. 

 
2. Challenging Gender Norms: A transgender person battles against societal 

expectations and discrimination, fighting for their right to be recognized and 
respected in a world that struggles to accept gender diversity. 

 
3. The Struggle for Accessibility: A wheelchair-user fights for accessibility in their 

town, encountering resistance from businesses and local authorities who are 
reluctant to make necessary changes. 

 
4. Exposing Corruption: An investigative journalist from a marginalized 

background delves into a story that exposes corruption within powerful 
institutions, putting their life and career at risk as they face threats from 
influential figures. 

 
5. Standing Against Hate: A person from a religious minority faces discrimination 

and prejudice, becoming an advocate for interfaith dialogue and 
understanding, despite facing resistance from extremist groups. 

 
6. Environmental Activism: A member of an Indigenous community takes on the 

fight against environmental destruction and exploitation of their ancestral 
lands, confronting multinational corporations and their political allies. 

 
7. Breaking the Glass Ceiling: An Aboriginal woman navigates the corporate 

world, striving to shatter racial and gender barriers, but faces obstacles and 
discrimination from colleagues and superiors. 

 
8. Standing Up for Immigrant Rights: An undocumented immigrant becomes a 

vocal advocate for immigrant rights, challenging the negative narratives and 
policies surrounding immigration in their country. 

 
9. Fighting for Education Equality: A teacher from an underprivileged 

neighbourhood campaigns for better resources and funding for their school, 
challenging the education system's inequities. 

 
10. The Quest for Healthcare Justice: A character from a low-income 

background becomes an activist for universal healthcare, pushing against a 
society that prioritizes profit over the health and well-being of its citizens. 

 
 
 
 


